





We have heard and worked to fix this issue and | was told that it had been resolved. If you can provide information for
her husband like ID number, etc or a contact for him, we can call and make sure everything is resolved so he is paid. We
of course agree this is something that needs to be fixed ASAP

From: Antonio Mireles <Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov < Caution-Caution-
mailto:Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov_< Caution-mailto:Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov %3c Caution-Caution-
mailto:Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov > >>

Sent: Monday, December 13, 2021 9:26 AM

To: Courtney Hjaltman <Courtney.Hjaltman@gov.texas.gov < Caution-Caution-
mailto:Courtney,Hialtman@gov.texas.gov < Caution-mailto:Courtney.Hjaltman@gov.texas.gov %3¢ Caution-Caution-
mailto:Courtney.Hjaltman@gov.texas.gov > > >

Subject: FW: INETMAIL: National Guard NOT BEING PAID

 [EXTERNAL SENDER] - Do not click on links or open attachments in unexpected messages.

Hi Courtney,

| hope all is welll | wanted to touch base and ask if this has come up on your radar? If so, do you have any advice on how
to handle this situation?

Thanks,

Antonio Mireles

Chief of Staff | Rep. Matt Shaheen (HD 66)

0:(512) 463-0594 | C: (817) 944-1481

Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov < Caution-mailto:Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov > < Caution-Caution-
mailto:Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov >

From: M F Shaheen <mfshaheen@house.texas.gov < Caution-Caution-mailto:mfshaheen@house.texas.gov_< Caution-
mailto:mfshaheen@house.texas.gov %3c Caution-Caution-mailto:mfshaheen@house.texas.gov >> >

Sent: Saturday, December 11, 2021 8:38 AM

To: Amy Rattleff <Amy.Rattleff@house.texas.gov < Caution-Caution-mailto:Amy.Rattleff@house.texas.gov < Caution-
mailto:Amy.Rattleff@house.texas.gov %3c Caution-Caution-mailto:Amy.Rattleff@house.texas.gov_> > >; Antonio
Mireles <Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov < Caution-Caution-mailto:Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov < Caution-
mailto:Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov %3c Caution-Caution-mailto:Antonio.Mireles@house.texas.gov > >>
Subject: Re: INETMAIL: National Guard NOT BEING PAID

Antonio, can you look into this? I know other Freedom Caucus members have received similar emails. Let me
know what’s going on. Thanks.

Regards,

Matt Shaheen

State Representative
District 66 - Collin County



Our Nation’s Motto “In God We Trust”

On Dec 9, 2021, at 7:52 PM, Amy Rattleff <Amy.Rattleffi@@house.texas.gov < Caution-Caution-
mailto:Amy.Rattlefficdhouse.texas.gov_< Caution-
mailto:Amy.Rattleff@house.texas.gov %3¢ Caution-Caution-

mailto:Amy.Rattleff@house.texas.gov > > > wrote:

To: District66 Shaheen <District66.Shaheen@house.texas.gov < Caution-Caution-
mailto:District66.Shaheen@house.texas.gov < Caution-
mailto:District66.Shaheen@house.texas.gov %3c Caution-Caution-
mailto:District66.Shaheen@house.texas.gov > > >

Subject: INETMAIL: National Guard NOT BEING PAID

Prefix: Mr

First Name: Caitlin
Middle Name: Marie
Last Name: Hagy
Suffix:

Title:

Business:

Adaress ine 1 SN

Address line 2:
City: [
State:

Subject:
National Guard NOT BEING PAID

Message:

My husband has been SEENEEEEIIEEEEE : 1 has NOT BEEN PAID! We live in

Plano and mortgage/bills aren€t cheap! Get these soldiers paid so we don€t lose our house!
We have 2 boys and this is right in the time of Christmas!!! Nothing says we love our troops like
we love you but we can€pt pay you! Please help us get these guys paid so they can get presents
of their kids for Christmas and they can pay their mortgages! Thank you Caitlin Hagy









TEXAS MILITARY DEPARTMENT
- POST OFFICE BOX 5218
AUSTIN, TX 78763-5218
(512) 782-5001

January 21, 2022

Sarah Hicks, Director -
Governor’s Office of Budget, Planning, and Policy
P.O. Box 12428 |
Austin, Texas 78711

Jerry McGinty, Director
Legislative Budget Board
P.O. Box 12666

Austin, Texas 78711

Subject: Texas Miiitafy Debéi‘tment Revised Réquest fo Exceed (RTE) Capital Budget
" Dear Ms. Hicks and Mr. McGinty,

In accordance with General Appropriations Act, Article 1X, Sections 14.03(a)(1) [Transfers —

Capital Budget], and-14.04(a) [Disaster Related Transfer Authority], the Texas Military

Department (TMD) submits this revised request for approval from the Governor and the

Legis|ative Budget Board to exceed by $4,344,720 the agency's capital budget appropriations
for the FY 2022 - 2023 biennium. : : . ;

This request replaces TMD's pending RTE of $2,000,000 submitted November 1, 2021, and

* the revised RTE filed January 18, 2022, to add an additional $6;600,000 to the initial request.
The requested authority will support TMD’s expenditure of funds in support of the Operation
Lone Star Mission, including automation requirements necessary to address quality of life
issues for soldiers on the border mission. A detailed summary of the additional equipment is
attached. :

Please contact me if you have any questions or additional information is required. Thank you
for your consideration of this request.. - : -

Sincerely,

Shelia Bailey Taylor C‘\d74r>

Director of State Administration
shelia.taylor@military.texas.gov
(512) 782-3390 ‘ ‘
















From: Shelia Taylor <shelia.taylor@military.texas.gov>

Sent: Friday, January 21, 2022 1:16 PM

To: Sarah.Hicks@gov.texas.gov; Jerry McGinty

Cc: -ordan Hale; Brady Franks; Michael Hull; Katy Fallon-Brown; Kelsey Vela;
Duvan Arsola

Subject: [Non-DoD Source] TMD Revised Request to Exceed Capital Budget Authority

Attachments: TMD Revised Request to Exceed Ltr.pdf

Ms. Hicks and Mr. McGinty,

Please find attached the Texas Military Department’s revised request to exceed the agency’s capital budget authority for
the FY 2022 — 2023 biennium.

This revision replaces any previous request to revise the agency’s capital budget for this period.
Respectfully,

Shelia Bailey Taylor

Director of State Administration
Office of State Administration
Texas Military Department
512-782-3390 Office
512-672-9094 Cell

“Texans Serving Texas”

































